










Choosing a commercial display provider. 
Buying boxes vs. building relationships 

Whether you're choosing a commercial display 

provider for guest-room TVs, cross-property 
digital signage, or both, it pays to think ahead. 

Years ahead. 

With LG, the relationship doesn't end when the 
sale is made. 

An effective partnership is the key differentiator 
of LG Business Solutions. This position is 
supported by the depth of LG's experience in each 
of its markets, the comprehensive technology 
leadership LG has consistently displayed, the 
quality of LG's support infrastructure and LG's 
proven reliability. 

LG offers end-to-end solutions that are renowned 

for innovation, and LG can extend the product life 

cycle for its hospitality customers, working closely 
with hoteliers to install individual products that 
are backward-compatible with existing 
infrastructures. Given the rapid speed at which 
technology evolves, continual installation and 
renovation are often cost-prohibitive for hoteliers. 
However, by working within a framework in which 
hotel owners can customize installations based on 
property needs, LG is able to serve as a 
collaborative partner and keep the owner's end 
goal at the forefront. 

From consultation and design to installation, 
integration, content creation/management and 
ongoing service & support, you can rely on LG 
commercial displays as the intelligent choice to 
shine bright and stand out. 
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